— G.Ocz_v_:ﬂo ad 58

State:Highway:142

tateiHighway 142 === ‘County/RoadiP. =S O3 - CountyiRoad/P

\

Ut

0
=,

:
=0
o
" I
=
=
=
=
§o
(%]

Denver:
L ]

Colorado




9/16/24, 4:03 PM Costilla County Mail - Annual Fee, Report, and Map Due

Annual Fee, Report, and Map Due

6 messages

Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>

Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 5:34

Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety <dnr_drms_permitadmin@state.co.us> AM

To: leroy.medina@costillacounty-co.gov
Cc: ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov, tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov

09/04/24

Annual Fee, Report, and Map Due

Under the terms of your NOI or Permit and Colorado Statutes, you must submit an Annual Fee and Annual Report
(including a map). You must pay the Annual Fee and submit an Annual Report each year until reclamation responsibility
release is granted. The Annual Fee is not a renewal fee. The Fee and Report are for last year’s exploration or mining and
reclamation season, and must be paid even if your operation was inactive.

If you have requested reclamation responsibility release from the Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (“Division")
but release has not been granted by the anniversary date listed below, the Annual Fee, Report and Map must be
submitted. If the permit is released before the anniversary date, then by Statute, it is not necessary to pay an Annual Fee
or submit an Annual Report for that year. The annual fee, report, and map are due on or before the Anniversary Date for
the following operation:

Permit: M1999024

ePermit Number: 414309

Operation Name: San Acacio Gravel Pit

Anniversary Date: 10/04/24

Total Fee Due: $791.00

As of January 1, 2018, all annual reports, maps and fees must be filed electronically. If you have not yet set up your
ePermitting account, click on the link below to get started:

https://drms.colorado.gov/information/epermitting

If you have already established your ePermitting account, click on the link below to file your report, upload your map, and
pay your fee online now.

https://dnrlaserfiche.state.co.us/Forms/DRMSeForms_LandingPage

If you need additional information or have any questions, please contact Chris Girardi at the Division of Reclamation,

Mining and Safety, 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO 80203, by telephone at (303) 328-5229 x, or by email at

chris.girardi@state.co.us.

Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>
To: Ben Doon <ben.doon@costillacounty-co.gov>

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=92d617c7eb6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f.1809265083486346442&simpl=msg-f:18092650834863464. ..

Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 8:52 AM
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Cc: David Perales <david.perales@costillacounty-co.gov>, Tara medina <tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov>, Julie Albert
<julie.albert@costillacounty-co.gov>, Chris Rodriguez <chris.rodriguez@costillacounty-co.gov>

Good morning,

| am wondering if we can solidify what, who and etc... as to whom these permits should truly fall under for responsibility.
It appears that Trinidad oversaw this back in the day, we need to enter specific names into the database for processing.

| know AP does their side for payment without question but wondering if in the near future who we can set up "org. chart "

wise for these.
Thanks.

aw

[Quoted text hidden]

Ayesha Williams

Accounts Payable / Payroll

Costilla County Commissioners Office
PO Box 100

San Luis, CO 81152

719-672-3372

Fax: 719-672-3962

Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>
To: Lucas Casias <lucas.casias@costillacounty-co.gov>

Hi Lucas,
Hope you are feeling better, can you get me a new map for this submission please? ugh.
aw

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety <dnr drms_permitadmin@state.co.us>
Date: Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 4:34 AM

Subject: Annual Fee, Report, and Map Due

To: <leroy.medina@costillacounty-co.gov>

Cc: <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>, <tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov>

[Quoted text hidden}

[Quoted text hidden]

Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 8:54 AM

Lucas Casias <lucas.casias@costillacounty-co.gov> Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 8:55 AM

To: Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>

Yeah I will work on that today Thank you for checking up on me How are you
doing?

Lucas

Lucas Casias
Emergency Manager/Costilla County GIS Coordinator/Noxious Weed Coordinator
Office: 719-672-9227
Cell: 719-298-8518

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=92d617c7eb6&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1809265083486 34644 2&simpl=msg-f:18092650834863464...
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lucas.casias@costillacounty-co.gov

[Quoted text hidden]

Chris Rodriguez <chris.rodriguez@costillacounty-co.gov> Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 9:03 AM

To: Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>
Cc: Ben Doon <ben.doon@costillacounty-co.gov>, David Perales <david.perales@costillacounty-co.gov>, Tara medina
<tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov>, Julie Albert <julie.albert@costillacounty-co.gov>

When | was the Land Use Administrator it went through Planning, not sure when that got switched over to the
Superintendent.
[Quoted text hidden]

Chris Rodriguez

Costilla County

Deputy County Administrator

Deputy Emergency Management Coordinator

Cell: 719.298.1797
Office: 719.672.3372

Tara medina <tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov> Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 9:18 AM

To: Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov>
Cc: Ben Doon <ben.doon@costillacounty-co.gov>, David Perales <david.perales@costillacounty-co.gov>, Julie Albert
<julie.albert@costillacounty-co.gov>, Chris Rodriguez <chris.rodriguez@costillacounty-co.gov>

The Planning and Zoning did them before but Leroy decide that it would be best if he did it because Planning doesn't
keep track of how many loads are taken out of the pits.

On Wed, Sep 4, 2024 at 8:53 AM Ayesha Williams <ayesha.williams@costillacounty-co.gov> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Tara Medina

Costilla County Planning & Zoning
P.O. Box 130

400 Gasper St # 105

San Luis, CO 8115

(719) 937-7668

THIS ISMY NEW EMAIL ADDRESS:
tara.medina@costillacounty-co.gov

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=92d617c7eb&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f: 1809265083486 34644 2&simpl=msg-f:18092650834863464...
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