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Gibson - DNR, Amber <amber.gibson@state.co.us> Fri, Aug 2, 2024 at 9:08 AM
To: Maryelizabethsciacca@gmail.com

Hi Mary,

Attached is a copy of the Division's MLRB hearing withdrawal notice for the Notice of Violation (NOV) for the Ferrero Pit (M-2000-028) from the August 2024 Board hearing.

As the letter states, please send the Civil Penalty payment via check to the address listed in the document within 30 days (by September 1, 2024).

Thanks again for working with us and for helping your Dad with this matter. Here is a link to a release request form for him to fill out so that we can schedule an inspection to assess
whether or not we can release his site this year: https://drive.google.com/file/d/1S7XBbituMeKorIiHjEgJhnNCwjJhdZWl/view

Thank you,

Amber M. Gibson 
Environmental Protection Specialist I

P 720.836.0967 |  F 303.832.8106 | 
amber.gibson@state.co.us 

Mailing: DRMS Room 215, 1001 E 62nd Ave, Denver, CO 80216
Physical: 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO 80203

https://drms.colorado.gov/

NOV Resolution Notice_Ferrero Pit_M2000028.pdf
285K

Gibson - DNR, Amber <amber.gibson@state.co.us> Wed, Aug 28, 2024 at 7:23 AM
To: Maryelizabethsciacca@gmail.com
Cc: Michael Ferrero <michaelanthonyferrero@gmail.com>

Good morning,

As of today, August 28, 2024, the Division has not yet received the civil penalty payment in the amount of $323.00. This is a reminder that the penalty payment is due September 1, 2024.
Please see the NOV Resolution document attached in the prior email for instructions on how to make the payment.

Thank you,

Amber M. Gibson 
Environmental Protection Specialist I

P 720.836.0967 |  F 303.832.8106 | 
amber.gibson@state.co.us 

Mailing: DRMS Room 215, 1001 E 62nd Ave, Denver, CO 80216
Physical: 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO 80203

https://drms.colorado.gov/

[Quoted text hidden]

Mary Sciacca <maryelizabethsciacca@gmail.com> Wed, Aug
To: "Gibson - DNR, Amber" <amber.gibson@state.co.us>
Cc: Michael Ferrero <michaelanthonyferrero@gmail.com>

Good morning Amber, 

My father sent this check in before you sent the email with the reference information. It turns out the check was returned back to him (I have attached the letter that was sent with the check). 

Can you please reply to this email and include the full instructions and where to send the check to again? Once received my father will get the check in the mail again. I am sorry for this confu





 

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 28, 2024, at 7:24 AM, Gibson - DNR, Amber <amber.gibson@state.co.us> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

Gibson - DNR, Amber <amber.gibson@state.co.us> Wed, Aug 28, 2024 at 9:12 AM
To: Mary Sciacca <maryelizabethsciacca@gmail.com>
Cc: Michael Ferrero <michaelanthonyferrero@gmail.com>

Hi Mary,

Thank you for letting me know. I was unaware that we received a check at all, otherwise I would have intercepted it, so I'm sorry for the confusion on the Division's end as well. Below are
the instructions for sending the Civil Penalty check.

Please, submit the civil penalty assessed in the amount of $323.00 to the Division by September 1, 2024. A check shall:

·       Be made payable to “Division of Reclamation, Mining, and Safety”.

·       Have the violation number “ Penalty No. MV-2024-012” in the memo line.

·       Be mailed to DRMS Room 215, 1001 E 62nd Ave, Denver, CO 80216. 

Thank you,

Amber M. Gibson 
Environmental Protection Specialist I

P 720.836.0967 |  F 303.832.8106 | 
amber.gibson@state.co.us 

Mailing: DRMS Room 215, 1001 E 62nd Ave, Denver, CO 80216
Physical: 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO 80203

https://drms.colorado.gov/
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