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DRMS annual fee for Giroux Pit 
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Scott - DNR, Eric <eric.scott@state.co.us> Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 12:14 PM
To: costraw@gmail.com

Please give me a call at my cell # 303-229-9414 at your earliest convenience so we can discuss the submission of the
required annual fee, report and map for the Giroux Pit, as well as the request for temporary cessation that we just
received.

Thank you, 
Eric Scott 
Environmental Protection Specialist, P.G., R.G.

P 303.866.3567 x 8140  |  F 303.832.8106   
1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO  80203
eric.scott@state.co.us  |  http://drms.colorado.gov

Christy Patterson <costraw@gmail.com> Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 2:21 PM
To: eric.scott@state.co.us

Dear Eric,
After speaking with Darell Geroux, he has decided that he does not want the temporary cessation. Could you please
refund the check to Geroux Land and Cattle 1100 CR 160 Westcliffe, CO 81252?
If you have any questions, then please contact me at 719-371-4928.
Thank you,
Christy Patterson

On Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 12:15 PM Scott - DNR, Eric <eric.scott@state.co.us> wrote: 
Please give me a call at my cell # 303-229-9414 at your earliest convenience so we can discuss the submission of the
required annual fee, report and map for the Giroux Pit, as well as the request for temporary cessation that we just
received.
 
Thank you, 
Eric Scott 
Environmental Protection Specialist, P.G., R.G.

 
P 303.866.3567 x 8140  |  F 303.832.8106   
1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO  80203
eric.scott@state.co.us  |  http://drms.colorado.gov

Scott - DNR, Eric <eric.scott@state.co.us> Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 2:27 PM
To: Michael Cunningham <michaela.cunningham@state.co.us>

Here's the withdrawal request for the Geroux Pix TC1.. Please let me know what I need to do to get their check sent
back.. 
Thanks. 
Eric Scott 
Environmental Protection Specialist, P.G., R.G.
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P 303.866.3567 x 8140  |  F 303.832.8106   
1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver, CO  80203
eric.scott@state.co.us  |  http://drms.colorado.gov

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Christy Patterson <costraw@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 2:21 PM 
Subject: Re: DRMS annual fee for Giroux Pit 
To: <eric.scott@state.co.us> 

Dear Eric,
After speaking with Darell Geroux, he has decided that he does not want the temporary cessation. Could you please
refund the check to Geroux Land and Cattle 1100 CR 160 Westcliffe, CO 81252?
If you have any questions, then please contact me at 719-371-4928.
Thank you,
Christy Patterson

On Wed, Feb 23, 2022 at 12:15 PM Scott - DNR, Eric <eric.scott@state.co.us> wrote: 
Please give me a call at my cell # 303-229-9414 at your earliest convenience so we can discuss the submission of the
required annual fee, report and map for the Giroux Pit, as well as the request for temporary cessation that we just
received.
 
Thank you, 
Eric Scott 
Environmental Protection Specialist, P.G., R.G.
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