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Allen - DNR, April <april.allen@state.co.us> Fri, Mar 27, 2020 at 1:26 PM
To: ap.admin@sbcompanies.com

Hello:

I am the accountant for the Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety and I'm attempting to contact Shawn Wise in
regards to the attached letter we received. We have received the new check for the Succession of Operator fee; however,
we have already deposited the December 27 check and we believe it successfully cleared the account. Typically, our
bank would immediately notify us if a check got returned due to a closed account and this has not happened. I would like
to request that Seifert Enterprises research with their bank in regards to check #011483 on the closed account and
confirm that it did get paid. The Division will continue holding the new check and we will either return it in the event that
check #011483 did clear the account or deposit it for the payment. At this time, we prefer to hold the check now rather
than prepare a payment later if this fee has already been paid. Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.
Thank you.

Sincerely,

April Allen
Accountant I

P 303.866-3567 ext. 8118  |   F 303.832.8106
1313 Sherman St., Room 215, Denver, CO 80203
april.allen@state.co.us  |  https://www.colorado.gov/drms
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Shawn Admin <ap.admin@sbcompanies.com> Fri, Mar 27, 2020 at 1:29 PM
To: "Allen - DNR, April" <april.allen@state.co.us>

We will check April.  Thank you.

Shawn Wise 
AP Clerk/Admin Assist.
SB Companies
ap.admin@sbcompanies.com

Seifert Enterprises LLC | 719-783-2757
www.sbcompanies.com

Beach Redi Mix, LLC | 719-783-3558
www.beachredimix.com

B&S Farm and Ranch, LLC | 719-783-2757

mailto:april.allen@state.co.us
https://www.colorado.gov/drms
https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ui=2&ik=7e5b0d741d&view=att&th=1711d755690bdba0&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_k8ak3kl10&safe=1&zw
mailto:ap.admin@sbcompanies.com
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.sbcompanies.com_&d=DwMFaQ&c=sdnEM9SRGFuMt5z5w3AhsPNahmNicq64TgF1JwNR0cs&r=crKIxc-nGZSdj6s7PXgIzfpMhbI_pOUgt0NX5VIHT0A&m=dl5BOO8vuCduq9abE5z4QRVUMkseMWJgCGsSBJPASJQ&s=fLDNFRrgDeD0SLMbzXmHVIfiLser8dZV5b_JQ4kSIT8&e=
https://urldefense.proofpoint.com/v2/url?u=http-3A__www.beachredimix.com_&d=DwMFaQ&c=sdnEM9SRGFuMt5z5w3AhsPNahmNicq64TgF1JwNR0cs&r=crKIxc-nGZSdj6s7PXgIzfpMhbI_pOUgt0NX5VIHT0A&m=dl5BOO8vuCduq9abE5z4QRVUMkseMWJgCGsSBJPASJQ&s=eS2EXQTTKltMhQ5NQddU-RNvtzOt9ohFGpanTebeirA&e=


Shared fax 719-783-2988

[Quoted text hidden]

Shawn Admin <ap.admin@sbcompanies.com> Tue, Mar 31, 2020 at 2:41 PM
To: "Allen - DNR, April" <april.allen@state.co.us>
Cc: Charity Lorenzen <b.mgr@sbcompanies.com>

Dear Ms. Allen,

We did check our bank and the 1st check did clear the bank.  The 2nd check we
sent from Stockman's bank can be mailed back.

Thank you,

Shawn Wise 
AP Clerk/Admin Assist.
SB Companies
ap.admin@sbcompanies.com

Seifert Enterprises LLC | 719-783-2757
www.sbcompanies.com

Beach Redi Mix, LLC | 719-783-3558
www.beachredimix.com

B&S Farm and Ranch, LLC | 719-783-2757
Shared fax 719-783-2988

On Fri, Mar 27, 2020 at 1:26 PM Allen - DNR, April <april.allen@state.co.us> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]

Allen - DNR, April <april.allen@state.co.us> Tue, Mar 31, 2020 at 3:05 PM
To: Shawn Admin <ap.admin@sbcompanies.com>
Cc: Scottie Tate - DNR <scottie.tate@state.co.us>, Patrick Lennberg - DNR <patrick.lennberg@state.co.us>

Hello Mr. Wise:

I will be sending the check back via certified mail tomorrow. Thank you for looking into this for us.

April Allen
Accountant I
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