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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Susan Amador 
Susan Amador, LLC 
938 Maple Street 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Ben  Pfeffer 
Raisin' Roots Farm 
2229 W. Vine Dr 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Hayes  Seubert 
849 Aztec Drive  
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Hilary  White 
1001 W Mountain Ave 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Cosmo Catalano 
228 Wood Street 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Maya Ortega 
301 E. Magnolia St.  Apt. GN 
Fort Collins, CO 80524 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Cheryl Distaso 
135 South Sunset Street 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Amy  Fleshman 
1619 W Vine Drive 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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September 20, 2018  
 
Maureen  DeCoursey 
316 West Street 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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1313 Sherman Street, Room 215 
Denver, CO 80203 
 

September 20, 2018  
 
Bill  Schenderlein 
Blue Earth Solutions, LLC 
PO Box 2427 
Fort Collins, CO 80522 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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September 20, 2018  
 
Richard Raines 
Tri-Districts 
4424 Laporte Ave 
Fort Collins, CO 80521 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
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September 20, 2018  
 
Eric Reckentine 
North Weld County Water District 
PO Box 56 
Lucerne, CO 80646 
 
 
RE: Notice of Formal Board Hearing, Pre-hearing Conference,  

and Recommendation Date for a 112c Application, 
 North Weld County Water District, 
 Lamb Lakes, File No. M-2018-039 
 
Dear Party and/or Interested Person: 
 
The Division of Reclamation, Mining and Safety (Division) appreciates you taking time to 
participate in the review process of the above referenced permit application.  The application for 
the Lamb Lakes was submitted to the Division on July 25, 2018, by North Weld County Water 
District (Applicant).  The application was considered filed for review on July 26, 2018.  The 
public comment period for the application closed on September 10, 2018.  The review period for 
the application will close on October 23, 2018. 
 
An explanation of the Division’s review process, your rights and responsibilities as either a party 
or a non-party, and the jurisdiction of the Mined Land Reclamation Board (Board), is provided in 
a 12-page memorandum, “Guide to Citizen Participation in the 112 Reclamation Permit 
Application Process for Construction Materials and Hard Rock/Metal Mining Operation”, dated 
October 2, 2001, revised January 12, 2006.  This memo is enclosed.  As noted in the citizen’s 
guide memo, in these proceedings the Division’s authority is limited to enforcement of the 
Colorado Land Reclamation Act for the Extraction of Construction Materials, 34-32.5-101 et 
seq., C.R.S. (Act) and the Mineral Rules and Regulation of the Colorado Mined Land 
Reclamation Board for the Extraction of Construction Materials (Rules).  The citizen’s guide 
memo, the Act and the Rules can be accessed through the Division’s website, 
http://mining.state.co.us. 
 
The Division has received written objections to the application.  Therefore, pursuant to Rule 
1.4.9(2)(a) and 1.7.4(2), the Division has scheduled the application for a Formal Board Hearing 
for consideration.  The hearing has been scheduled for the November 14 and 15, 2018 Board 
meeting, which will occur at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 318, Denver, Colorado, beginning at 
9:00 a.m. or as soon thereafter as the matter can be considered.  During the hearing the Board 
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will consider the application with objections and may decide to approve, approve with 
conditions, or deny the application for the Lamb Lakes. 
 
Pursuant to Rule 2.7, the Division has scheduled a Pre-hearing Conference to occur on Friday 
October 26, 2018 beginning at 9:15am and will end no later than 11:30am.  The Pre-hearing 
Conference will be held to describe the Division’s review process, to explain the rights and 
responsibilities of parties, to discuss and resolve issues to the extent possible, to describe the 
Board Hearing processes, to propose a list of issues under the Board’s jurisdiction, to simplify 
that list, and to identify parties.  The Pre-hearing Conference will occur at the Council Tree 
Library at 2733 Council Tree Ave. #200, Fort Collins, Colorado 80525 in Meeting Room C.   
 
Pursuant to Rule 1.4.9, on or before October 23, 2018, the Division shall issue its 
recommendation to the Board for approval, approval with conditions, or denial of the 
application.  A copy of the Division’s recommendation will be forwarded to all parties and 
interested persons. 
 
Please contact me at the Division’s office at 1313 Sherman Street, Room 215, Denver Colorado 
80523 or at (303) 866-3567 ext. 8120, if you have any questions. 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Jared Ebert 
Environmental Protection Specialist III 
 
Enclosure: Guide to Citizen Participation 
 
ec w/enclosure: Michael Cunningham, DRMS Senior Environmental Protection Specialist 
 


